
Campbell Elementary and Dickinson Elementary Track and Synthetic Turf Fields 

Fielder's Choice FieldTurf Hayden Paving Hellas Construction IKLO Construction Paragon Sports Constructors Texas Sports Builders

PROPOSAL BOND: YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED (1 & 2): YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Base Proposal: $2,572,184.00 $2,195,028.00 $2,103,012.00 $2,204,000.00 $2,400,000.00 $2,350,103.00 $1,932,615.00 

Alternate No.1:
Campbell Elementary Select Fill at Track; $19,830.00 $133,125.00 $110,000.00 $200,000.00 $40,000.00 $95,412.00 $174,106.00 

Alternate No. 2:
Campbell Elementary Select Fill at Track and Turf 
Field;

$136,028.00 $336,806.00 $302,500.00 $617,000.00 $237,000.00 $482,816.00 $496,365.00 

Alternate No. 3:
Campbell Elementary Moisture Conditioning at Track 
and Turf Field

$100,324.00 $119,813.00 $119,000.00 $118,000.00 $560,000.00 $97,131.00 $314,280.00 

Alternate No. 4:
Dickinson Elementary Select Fill at Large Turf Field $142,850.00 $318,435.00 $286,000.00 $596,000.00 $230,000.00 $421,006.00 $268,390.00 

Alternate No. 5:
Dickinson Elementary Select Fill at Track and Turf 
Fields

$217,357.00 $382,734.00 $343,750.00 $875,500.00 $325,000.00 $601,691.00 $407,862.00 

Alternate No. 6:
Dickinson Elementary Moisture Conditioning at Track 
and Turf Fields

$134,000.00 $173,063.00 $163,000.00 $164,000.00 $800,000.00 $122,184.00 $398,200.00 

Alternate No. 7:
10mm Full-Pour Track Surfacing $28,785.00 $138,254.00 $27,533.00 $88,000.00 $11,000.00 ($31,517.00) $35,465.00 

Alternate No. 8:
Alternate Infill System NO BID $149,850.00 $164,835.00 $172,000.00 $305,000.00 $20,341.00 NO BID

Alternate No. 9:
Alternate Infill System NO BID NO BID INCLUDED IN

ALTERNATE 8 NO BID INCLUDED IN
ALTERNATE 8 NO BID NO BID

BASE PROPOSAL + ALTERNATES 3,6,7,8. N/A $2,776,008.00 $2,577,380.00 $2,746,000.00 $4,076,000.00 $2,558,242.00 N/A

PROPOSAL TABULATION SHEET

General Contractors

Proposal Date/Time:  Monday, August 7, 2017 at 2:00 PM
Lamar Consolidated Independent School District

LCISD CSP: 27-2017PBK
PBK Project Number: 17192SP
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Vendors Proposed Price

Purchase    
Price           

Criteria 1     
max 20pts

Reputation 
of Service    
Criteria 2 
max 15pts

Quality of 
Vendor's good 
or services     
Criteria 3      
max 10pts

Extent to     
meet needs  
Criteria 4     
max 15pts

Past 
Relation     
Criteria 5 
max 5pts 

Experience and 
knowledege base 

to project        
Criteria 6         
max 15pts

Staff & 
Insurance    
Criteria 7 
max 10pts

Safety 
Record      
Criteria 8 
max 10pts

TOTAL     
POINTS

Hayden Paving $2,577,380.00 19.9 15 10 15 5 15 10 6 96

Paragon Sports $2,558,242.00 20.0 15 10 15 3 15 10 6 94

FieldTurf $2,776,008.00 18.4 15 10 15 5 15 10 6 94

Hellas Construction $2,746,000.00 18.6 15 9 14 3 15 10 4 89

Fielder's Choice (EnviroTurf) $2,835,293.00 * 18.0 15 7 12 3 12 10 4 81

IKLO Construction $4,076,000.00 12.6 10 6 10 1 10 5 5 60

Texas Sports Builders $2,680,560.00 * 19.1 10 7 12 3 10 10 6 77

* Offeror indicated "no bid" on alternate 8
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